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Bid Tabulation - Bid Opening, Tuesday, June 15, 2010 @ 2:00 P.M.
City of Friendswood

Surface Water Plant #2, Ground Storage Tank Addition

LJA Project No. E080-0560

W. W. Payton Corporation

P.O. Box 1056

Katy, Texas 77492
PH: 281.371.7068

Blastco Texas, Inc.

5514 Easthampton Drive
Houston, Texas 77039
PH:; 281.590.3200

Schier Construction Co., Inc.
14250 Schroeder Road
Houston, Texas 77070

PH: 281.469.,1822

23602 Botkins,

PH: 281.351.8383
Fax:

Nunn Constructors, Lid.

Hockley, Texas 77447

Circle P. Welding, Inc.
1708 Sandalwood Drive
Norman, OK 73701
PH: 405.360.5328"
Fax: 405.360.2260

FRN F-1386 Fax; 281.371.7069 Fax; 281.590.3234 Fax: 281.469.1373
Wesley W. Payton, President |Jay Soper, General Manager |James E. Schier, President  |David G. Gunn, President Robert Plumlee, President
NO: ;0 DESCRIP L Ty uNE CBERJTEM™ | PRIGE PER FTEM | E ] PERITEM. | ° PRICE" ERITEML
1 One Million Gallon Steel Ground Storage Water Tank as 1 L.S. $535,000.00 $535,000.00 | $583,000.00 | $583,000.00 | $603,300.00 | $603,300.00 | $601,000.00 j $601,000.00 | $882,516.00 $882,516.0
Shown on the Pians and as Described in the
Specifications, Complete in Place.
2 |One Millicn Gallon Pre-stressed Concrete VWater Tank as 1 LS. $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00

Shown on the Plans and as Described in the
Specifications, Complete in Place.
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3 [Bxtra” B'é'nk Séﬁd; Complete lh'Place. B

~$15.00

$4.500.00

$3,000.00 |

~$10.00

Lo R
$3,000.00

$3.000.00

$23.00

"$6,900.00

Y. $10.00 $10.00
4 [|"Extra" Crushed Limestone, Complete in Place 200 cC.Y. $25.00 $5,000.00 $25.00 $5,000.00 $25.00 $5,000.00 $25.00 $5,000.00 $50.00 $10,000.00
5 [|"Extra" Cement Stabilized Sand, 2.0 Sacks Per Ton, 50 TON $30.00 $1,500.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00
Complete in Place.
6 |'Extra" Class A Concrete, Complete in Place. 60 C.Y. $100.00 $6,000.00 $100.00 $6,000.00 $100.00 $6,000.00 $400.00 $24,000.00 $250.00 $15,000.00
7 |"Exira" Reinforcing Steel, Complete in Place. 1,000 LBS. $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $2.00 $2,000.00
Total Amount Bid: ([tems 1, 3,4, 5, 6 and 7) STEEL TANK $553,000.00 $599,500.00 $619,800.00 $635,500.00 $918,916.00
Total Amount Bid: {ltems 2, 3,4, 5, 6 and 7) CONCRETE TANK No Bid No Bid No Bid No. Bid No Bid
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Bid Tabulation - Bid Opening, Tuesday, June 15, 2010 @ 2:00 P.M.
City of Friendswood

Surface Water Plant #2, Ground Storage Tank Addition

LJA Project No. EOB0-0560

FRN F-1386

Natgun Corparation

11 Teal Road

Wakefield, MA 01880
PH: 781.246.1133
Fax: 781.224.5163
Stephen P. Boyle, VP

Preload, Inc.
B0 Commerce Drive
Hauppauge, NY 11788
PH: 631.231.8100
Fax: 631.231.8881
Jack Hornstein, VP
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1 OneM|EI|on GélldrramSteeI‘ Ground ‘S‘torage‘Watér Tank as 1
Shown on the Plans and as Described in the
Specifications, Complete in Place.

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00 ~$0.00

2 |One Million Gallon Pre-stressed Concrete Water Tank as 1
Shown on the Plans and as Described in the

LS.

Specifications, Complete in Place.

670,000.00

$670,000.00

733,000.00 | $733,000.00

., “"_:‘s’;!““k Srmiin b L - - S . AR EIENENREOO S 1 i
3 |"Extra" Bank Sand, Complete in Place. 300 CY. $10.00 '$3,000.00 $12.00 '$3,600.00
4 i"Extra" Crush_ed Limestone, Complete in Place 200 c.Y. $25.00 $5,00Q.00_ $35.00 $7,0D0.00
5 |"Extra" Cement Stabilized Sand, 2.0 Sacks Per Ton, 50 TON $30.00 $1,500.00 $40.00 $2,000.00
Complete in Place.
6 |"Extra" Class A Concrete, Complete in Place. 80 cY. $100.00 $6,000.00 $120.00 $7,200.00
7 |"Extra" Reinforcing Steel, Complete in Place. 1,000 | LBS. © $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.20 $1,200.00
Total Amount Bid: (items 1, 3,4, 5, 6 and 7) STEEL TANK No Bid No Bid
Total Amount Bid: {Items 2, 3,4, 5,6 and 7) CONCRETE TANK $686,500.00 $754,000.00




