BID TABULATION FOR:

BID OPENING DATE:

BID OPENING LOCATION:
TABULATION BY:
TABULATION DATE:

LJA JOB ND.

BIDUER'S NAME

1) G.F MCDOMALD ELECTRIC, INC.

2) W.W. PAYTON CORPORATION

3] HETECH ELECTRIC, INC.

4) NBG CONSTRUCTORS, INC.

3] GEMINI CONTRACTING SERVICES, INC.

6] BOYER, INC.

CALENDAR DAYS - 150/160

SO0 KW WATER FLANT EMERGENCY POWER GENERATOR
TO SERVE HARRIS COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY EISTRICT NO, 222

CITY OF HOUSTON ET..
HARRIS COLINTY, TEXAS
FEBRUARY 4, 2010

LJA ENGINEERING & SURVEYING INC,

S.ROSS
FEBRUARY 4, 2010
0481-2235V {9 2}

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

$164,219.00
$164.000.00
$798,340.00
$243,300.00
$244.000.00

$324.350.00

-

ALTERNATE
BID ITEM NO. 1

$172,469 00
NO BiD
$207.,500.00
5186,000.00
NO BID

$265,000.00

I, David R Trney, P.E., hereby certif\lhesg bid tabulations fo be true &@w.

* MATHEMATICAL ERROR

10f8

ALTERNATE
BIDITEM 2

§4,000.00
NC BID
$13,890.00
$4,000.00
NC BID

$16,500.00

ALTERNATE
BID'ITEM 3

$8.500.00
$8.000.00
$8,270.00
$5.500.00
$10,000.00

E14.813.00

ALTERNATE
BID TEM 4

$8,500.00
NO BID

51553000

$5,500.00
NO 81D

514,213.00

FRN F-13%&
LJA Enginearing Sunasying, Inc.
D TLANDAOAS 1WMET. 2235000 IO Gemnaraior_ BT



BID TABULATION FOR:

BiD OPENING DATE:

BIiD OPENING LOCATION:
TABULATION BY:
TABULATION DATE:

LJA JOB NO.

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

BASE Qi ITEMS

-

o

-

2

. 500 KW DIESEL GENERATOR W¥ITH SUB BASE FUEL TANK, CONCRETE

FOUNDATION, ELECTRICAL COMPONENTS AND ALL APPURTENANGES,
COMPLETE IN PLACE

COMPLETE DEMOLISHMENT AND PROPER DISPOSAL OF EXISTING CONCRETE
PAD, COMPLETE IN FLACE

. SITE WORK INCLUDING 47 THICK CONCRETE PAYEMENT, FIPE BOLLARDS,

GRADING, HYDROMULCH SEEDING OF ALL DISTURBED AREAS, AND ALL
REQUIRED APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

17 WATER LINE (OUCTILE IRON), INCLUDING FITTINGS, THRUST BLOCKS,
TRENCH SAFETY, AND ALL APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

FLUSH AND DISINFECT, AND PERFORM BACTERICOLOGICAL TEST OF WATER
LINE, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EXTERNAL FUEL POLISHING SYSTEM INCLUDING COMPLETE INSTALLATION
AND INTEGRATION WITH FUEL TANK, COMPLETE IN PLACE

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ITEMS

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

-

. INSTALLATION AND MAINTENANCE OF STORMWATER POLLUTION PREVENTION

ITEMS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EXTRA CEMENT STABILIZED SAND, (TQ BE USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF
THE ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE

. ABANDON AND FLLIG EXISTING 12° WATER LINE, GOMPLETE IN PLACE

. SALVAGE VALUE (CREDIT FOR EXISTING 300 KW DIESEL GENERATOR AND

FUEL TANK TO BE REMOVED), COMPLETE IN PLACE

SUETOTAL MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

* MATHEMATICAL ERROR,

LINIT

LS

LS

LF

LS

LS

[

Ls

LS

aTy

35

500 KW WATER PLANT EMERGENCY FOWER GENERATOR
TO SERVE HARRIS COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 222

CITY OF HOUSTON E.T.J.
HARRIS COUNTY, TEXAS
FEBRUARY £, 2010

LJA ENGINEERING & SURVEYING ING.

S.ROSS
FEBRUARY 4, 2010
0461-2235W (9.2}

1) C.F. MCDONALD ELECTRIC, INC

UNIT COST

$152 469.00

$3,50000

$22,000 Q0

§285.1

$1.000 060

$5,900.00

51,500.00

$150.00

$1,000.00

($13.,500.00)

2ol5

TOTAL COST

£152,469.00

$3,500.00

$22,000.00

$10.000.00

$1,000.00

$5,500.00

$194,469.00

§1.500.00

$750.00

$1.000.00

($13,500.00)

($10,250.040)

2) W.W. PAYTON CORPORATION

UNIT COST

$180,000.00

$2,000.00

£3.000.00

$100.00

$500.00

$6,000.00

$500.00

$40.00

$30000

(58,000 00)

TOTAL COST

$180,000.00

$2.,000.00

$3,000.00

$2,500.00

$500.00

$6,000 00

$195,000.00

$500.00

$200.00

$300.00

($8,000.00)

{37,000.00}

3 HI-TECH ELECTRIC, INC.

UNIT COST

$157.930.00

$6,130.00

54 360.00

$403.43

$1,570.00

$11,500.00

$210.00

E100.00

$£320.00

{$300.00

TOTAL COST

$157,530.00

$6,130.00

$4.360.00

$14,120.00

$1,570.00

$11,500.00

$195,610.00

$210.00

$500.00

£220.00

{5300.00)

$730.00

FAN F-1386

LJA Engunesring Sunmeying, (ne
3 VAN DA | WME 1- 225 50 IO Sanvaretor_BT



EID TABULATION FOR:

EID OPENING DATE:

BID OPENING LOCATION:
TABELATION BY:
TABULATION DATE:

LJA OB NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ALTERNATE BID ITEMS

1. USED REFURBISHED 500 KW DIESEL ONAN GENERATOR WITH CUMMING

ENGINE, WITH LESS THAN 20 HOURS OF RUN TIME, INCLUDES NEW FUEL TANK,

PROPER DISFOSAL OF EXISTING FUEL TANK, SOUND ENCLOSURE, FUEL
MANAGEMENT SYSTEM, CONCRETE FOUNDATION, ELECTRICAL COMPONENTS
AND ALE APPURTENANCES, IN LIEU OF BASE BID ITEM NC. 1. UNIT PRICE BID
SHALL ALSO INCLUDE ANY AND ALL MODHFICATIONS REQUIRED TQ MEET
TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS SECTIONS 16213, 16612 AND 16612 S, COMPLETE
IN PLACE

M

. ON-SITE INDLICTIVE LOAD BANK TEST FOR THE USED GENERATOR BY
CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLANS, LLC PRIOR TO PURCHASE, SUCCESSFLL
TESTING IN ACCORDANCE WITH TECHNICAL SPECIFICATION SECTION 16612 S,
PARAGRAPH 7.A.1 SHALL BE REQUIRED FOR ACCEPTANCE OF ALTERMATE BID
ITEM NO. 1, COMPLETE IN FLACE

24

STAINLESS STEEL EXHAUST SYSTEM FOR NEW GENERATOR PER TECHNICAL
SPECIFICATIONS SECTION 16612 3 PARAGRAPH 2, COMPLETE IN FLACE

-

. BTAINLESS STEEL EXHAUST S8YSTEM FOR USED GENERATOR PER TECHNICAL
SPECIFICATION SECTIONS SECTION 16612 S FARAGRAPH 2, COMPLETE IN
PLACE

SUBTOTAL ALTERNATE BID ITEMS

BID SUMMARY

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ITEMS
SUBTOTAL MISCELLANEQUS |TEMS

TFOTAL AMOUNT BID

ALTERNATE DID ITEMS

ITEM NO. 1 USED GENERATOR

(TEM NC. 2 INDUCTIVE LOAD BANK TEST

ITEM NO. 3 58 EXHAUST FOR NEW GENERATOR

ITEM NO. 4 88 EXHAUST FOR USED GENERATOR

" MATHEMATICAL ERROR

UNIT

LE

LS

500 KW WATER PLANT EMERGENCY POWER GENERATOR
TO SERVE HARRIS COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 222

CITY OF HOUSTON E.T..
HARRILS COUNTY, TEXAS
FEBRUARY 4, 2010

LJA ENGINEERING & SURVEYING INC.

5. ROSS
FEBRUARY 4, 2010
0461-2238w (92)

i} C.F MCDONALD ELECTRIC, INC.

aQry UNIT COST
1 5$172.469.00
1 $4,000.00
1 $6,500.00
1 $B.506.00
dofs

TOTAL COST

$172 468 00

54.,000.00

58.500.00

§8,500.00

$193,469.00

194 469.00
($10,250.00)

$184.245.00

£172,469.00
$4,000.00
§8,500.00

$8,500.00

27 WW. PAYTON CORPORATION

UNIT COST

NO BID

NO BID

$8,000.00

RO BID

TOTAL COST

NOBID

NO BID

£8,000.00

NG BID

$6,000.00

£195,000.00
(57,000.00)

$i80.000.00

NQ BID
NO BID
$8,000.00

NQ BID

3) HLETECH ELECTRIC, INC.

UNIT COST

$207,500.00

513,820.00

$8.270.00

$15,530.00

TOTAL COST

$207.500.00

$13.890.00

$8.270.00

$15,530.00

$245,190.00

$185,610.00
$730.00

$196,340.00

$207,500.00
$13,890.00
$8,270.00

£15,530.00

FRN F-1326

LJA Eaqneanng Survemng, Inc
OVLAMDUME 170451 - ZTHTANSMH KW Semrior_BT



BID TABULATION FOR:

BID OPENING DATE:

BID OPENING LOCATION:
TABULATION BY:
TABULATION DATE:

LJA JOB NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

BASE BID ITEMS

-

. 500 KW DIESEL GENERATOR WITH SUB BASE FUEL TANK, CONCRETE
FOUNDATION, ELECTRICAL COMPONENTS AND ALL AFPURTENANCES,
COMPLETE IN PLACE

N

COMPLETE DEMOLISHMENT AND PROPER DISPOSAL OF EXISTING CONCRETE
PaD, COMPLETE iIN FLACE

o

SITE WORK INCLUDING 4* THICK CONCRETE PAVEMENT, PIPE BOLLARDS,
GRADING, HYDROMULCH SEEDING OF ALL DISTURBED AREAS, AND ALL
REQUIRED APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

Bl

12" WATER LINE (DUCTILE IRON}, INCLUDING FITTINGS, THRUST BLOCKS,
TRENCH SAFETY, AND ALL APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

h

. FLUSH AND DISINFECT, AND PERFORM BACTERIOLOGICAL TEST OF WATER
LINE, COMPLETE IN FLACE

6. EXTERNAL FUEL POLISHING SYSTEM INCLUDNG COMPLETE INSTALLATION
AND INTEGRATION WITH FUEL TANK, COMPLETE IN PLACE
SUBTOTAL BASE EID ITEMS
MISCELL ANEOUS ITEMS

1. INSTALLATION AND MAINTEMANCE OF STORMWATER FOLLUTION PREVENTHIN
ITEMS, COMPLETE ™N PLACE

2. EXTRA CEMENT STABILIZED SAND, {TO BE USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF
THE ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE

3. ABANDON AND PLUG EXISTING 12" WATER LINE, COMFLETE IN FLACE

4. SALVAGE VALUE (CREDIT FOR EXISTING 300 K¥¥ DIESEL GENERATOR AND
FLUEL TANK TO BE REMOVED), COMPLETE IN PLACE

SUBTOTAL MISCELLANEOUS ITEWS

* MATHEMATICAL ERRCR

UNIT

Ls

LS

LF

LS

LS

cY

LS
LS

ary

35

00 KW WATER PLANT EMERGENCY POWER GENERATOR
TO BERVE HARRIS COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NG, 222

CITY OF HOUSTON E.T.J.
HARRIS COUNTY, TEXAS
FEBRUARY 4, 2010

LJA ENGINEERING & SURVEYING INC.

5.ROSS
FEBRLARY 4, 2010
0461-2235W (9.2)

4) NBG CONSTRUGTORS, INC.

UNIT COST

$192.000 00

55,000.00

37.000.00

$380.00

$2,000.00

$15.000.00

$1.000.00

$200.00

$2,000.00

£5,000.00

4ol 5

TOTAL COST

§182,000.00

$5.000.00

$7.000.00

$13,300.00

$2,000.00

£15,000 00

5234,300.00

$1,000.00

$1.,000.00

§2,000.00

£5,000.00

$9,000.00 *

9} GEMINI CONTRACTING SERVICES, INC.

UNIT COST

5194 000.00

$3,000.00

$7.000.00

§600.00

$2,000.00

$11,000.00

$500.00

550,00

$5,000.00

$250.00

TOTAL COST

$194,000.00

$3,000.00

57,000.00

$21.000.00

$2.000.00

$11,000.00

$238,000.04

3500.00

$250.00

$5,000.00

$250.00

$6,000.00

6} BOYER, INC.
UNIT COST TOTAL COST

$275.000.00 $275,000.00
56,500.00 $6,500.00
$12,000.00 $12,000.00
$38500 $12,775.00
52,500.00 $2.500.00
$12,500.00 $12,500 00
$321.275.00

$2,500.00 $2,500.00
$115.00 357500
$500.00 $500.00
($500.00) ($500.00)
$3,075.00

FRH F-1386

O SLANDMO4ET

LJA Engmeenng Surveying, Ine.

BT -ZEITNNSO0 KNV Genaralor BT



BID TABULATION FOR:

BID OPENING DATE:

BID OPENING LOCATION:
TABULATION BY:
TABULATION DATE:

LIA JOB NO.

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

ALTERNATE BID ITEMS

-

g

(]

&

. USED REFURBISHED 500 KW DIESEL OMAN GENERATOR WITH CUMMING
ENGINE, WITH LESS THAN 20 HOURS OF RUN TIME, INCLUDES NEW FUEL TANEK,

PROPER DISPOSAL OF EXISTING FUEL TANK, SOUND ENCLOSURE, FUEL
MANAGEMENT SYSTEM, CONCRETE FOUNDGATION, ELECTRICAL COMPONENTS
AND ALL APPURTENANCES, IN LIEU OF BASE BID ITEM NO. 1. UNIT PRICE BID
SHALL ALSDQ INCLUDE ANY ANC ALL MODIFICATIONS REQUIRED TO MEET
TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS SECTIONS 16213, 16612 AND 16612 S, COMPLETE
IN PLACE

ON-SITE INDUCTIVE LOAD BANK TEST FOR THE USED GENERATOR BY
CUMMING SOUTHERN PLANS, LLC FRICR TO PURCHASE, SUCCESSFUL
TESTING IN ACCCRDANCE WITH TECHNICAL SPECIFICATION SECTION 16612 8,
FARAGRAPH 7.A.1 SHALL BE REQUIRED FOR ACCEPTANCE OF AL TERNATE BID
ITEM NO. 1, COMPLETE [N PLAGE

. STAINLESS STEEL EXHAUST SYSTEM FOR NEW GENERATOR PER TECHNICAL

SPECIFICATIONS SECTION 16612 S PARAGRAPH 2, COMPLETE IN PLACE

. STAINLESS STEEL EXHAUST SYSTEM FOR USED GENERATOR PER TECHNICAL

SPECIFICATION SECTIONS SECTION 18812 & PARAGRAPH 2, COMPLETE IN
PLACE

SUBTOTAL AL TERNATE BILHITEMS

B SUMMARY,

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ITEMS

SUBTOTAL MISCELLANECQUS ITEMS

TOTAL AMOUNT BiD

AL TERNATE BID ITEMS
ITEM KO. 1 USED GENERATOR

ITEM NO. 2 INDUCTVE LOAD BANK TEST

ITEM NO. 3 58 EXHAUST FOR NEW GENERATOR

ITEM NO. 4 55 EXHALIST FOR USED CENERATOR

" MATHEMATICAL ERROR

LUINIT

LS

LS

L3

QTY

SO0 KW WATER PLANT EMERGENCY POWER GENERATOR
TQ SERVE HARRIS COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NG, 222

CITY OF HQUSTCONE.T )
HARRIS COUNTY, TEXAS
FEERUARY 4, 2010

LJA ENGINEERING & SURVEYING INC,

5. ROSS
FEBRUARY 4, 2010
(0461-2235W (9.2}

4) NBG CONSTRUCTORS, INC.

UNIT COST

5188,000 Q0

$4,000.00

§5,500.00

$5,500.00

5ol S

TOTAL COST

$188.000 00

$4,000.00

35.500.00

35.500.00

$203,000.00

5234,300.00
$9.000.00

$243,30.00

$188,000.00
$4,000.00
$5.500.00

$5,500.00

5) GEMINI CONTRACTING SERVICES, INC.

UNIT COST

NO BID

NOEID

$10,000.00

NG BID

TOTAL COST

NG BIC

NO BED

$10,000.00

NQ BID

$10.000.00

$232,000.00
§6,000.00

$244,000.00

NC B
NO 8D
510,000.00

NG BD

&) BOYER, INC.
UNIT COST TOTAL COST

$265,000.00 $265,000.00
$16,500.00 $16.500.00
$14.813.00 $14,513.00
$14,813.00 $14,813.00
$311,126.00
321 27500
$3,075.00
$3124,350.00
$265,000.00
$16,500.00
$14,813.00
$14,513.00

FAM F-1386

LJA Enginesnng Sunmying. Ino

CFUA NCHOAE 1046 1 22350 500 KW Sanerator_BT



